Technical Note: 2.4Temporal.001
Author: Monica Palmirani

Date: August 3, 2012

Contributors: 
1. Temporal Parameters
1.1. Internal and External Temporal Parameters
The norms are expressed through legal statements. Usually the text is the preferred medium used for expressing the normative obligations, permissions, prohibitions or for defining constitutive norms (e.g. definitions) or other types of norms (see Gordon, Rotolo, Governatori, RuleML2009).
The normative text usually is affected by different temporal parameters: 

· External and Internal temporal parameters;

· Dynamic and Static temporal parameters;

· Events and Intervals.

1.1.1. External and Internal

External time is the time not stated in the norm but that leads the lifecycle of the provision. It usually comes from external processes such as the legislative process or other norms (Gundernorm, Kelsen) and it can be one of the following: date of creation, date of promulgation, date of publication, date of delivery, date of enter in force, date of efficacy.
Internal time is the time specified in the norm or better the time described by the norm (e.g. events connected to the obligations, permission, prohibitions, etc.). These kind of temporal parameters belong to the textual description of the norm: e.g. the tax is applicable to the earns of the financial year 2012-2013. 
1.1.2. Dynamic and Static

Static time primarily describes a normative document in its entirety, as approved by the endorsed authority (e.g. Parliament, Government, etc.). A text partition can inherit static time descriptors from the document that contains it. An example of static time is the date of publication of an Act.

Dynamic time primarily describes text partitions and can be garnered by reasoning from the attributes of the enclosing document. Thus, dynamic time results from fitting together the dynamic time markers pertaining to different text partitions. An example of dynamic external time is the enter into force of a section, it depends from the sequences of modifications over time. An example of dynamic internal time is the following “the tax period is calculated from the Jan 1st 
1.1.3. Events and Intervals

Event: punctual time (TBD)
Interval: range of time (TBD)

1.2. Temporal Parameters in the Body, Head, Atom and Rule
2.  Metamodel

Event associcatedWith textualResource
Event compose Interval (1:2 – 1)

Interval hasType Type (e.g. efficacy, inforce, assent, publication, registration, etc. 1-1)

Interval compose TimeBlock (N:M relationtiship)
TimeBlock associcatedWith rule (N:M relationship)

TimeBlock associcatedWith atom (N:M relationship)

TimeBlock associcatedWith head (N:M relationship)

TimeBlock associcatedWith body (N:M relationship)

Rules hasType Metarule

Metarule change TimeBlock

3. Pilot Case1

History of the Sec. 504 US Code, Title 17, Chapter 5.
	URIRef
	Sources
	Action
	Date of Assent
	Efficacy Date

	V1@1978-01-01
	Pub. L. 94–553, title I, § 101,Oct. 19, 1976, 90 Stat. 2585; 
	Insert of 504
	Oct. 19, 1976
	January 1, 1978

	V2@1989-03-01
	Pub. L. 100–568, § 10(b),Oct. 31, 1988, 102 Stat. 2860; 
	“Amended paragraph 504(c)(1) by substituting "$500" for "$250" and "$20,000" for "$10,000"
Amended paragraph 504(c)(2) by substituting "$100,000" for "$50,000" and "$200" for "$100".”
	October 31, 1988
	March 1, 1989

	V3@1997-11-13
	Pub. L. 105–80, § 12(a)(13),Nov. 13, 1997 , 111 Stat. 1535;
	(12) The item relating to section 504 in the table of sections at the beginning of chapter 5 is amended by striking ‘‘Damage’’ and inserting ‘‘Damages’’. 

(13) Section 504(c)(2) is amended by striking ‘‘court it’and inserting ‘‘court in’’.”
	NOV. 13, 1997
	NOV. 13, 1997

	V4@1999-01-25
	Pub. L. 105–298, title II, § 204,Oct. 27, 1998, 112 Stat. 2833; 
	Add the item (d) ADDITIONAL DAMAGES IN CERTAIN CASES.—
	Oct. 27, 1998
	January 25, 1999

	V5@1999-12-09
	Pub. L. 106–160, § 2,Dec. 9, 1999, 113 Stat. 1774; 
	Section 504(c) of title 17, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) by striking ‘‘$500’’ and inserting ‘‘$750’’; and

(B) by striking ‘‘$20,000’’ and inserting ‘‘$30,000’’; and

(2) in paragraph (2), by striking ‘‘$100,000’’ and inserting ‘‘$150,000’’.”
	Dec. 9, 1999
	Dec. 9, 1999

	V6@2004-12-23
	Pub. L. 108–482, title II, § 203,Dec. 23, 2004, 118 Stat. 3916; 
	Add (3) items

(A), (B), (C) 
	Dec. 23, 2004
	Dec. 23, 2004

	V7@2010-12-09
	Pub. L. 111–295, § 6(f)(2),Dec. 9, 2010, 124 Stat. 3181.)
	(2) Section 504(c)(2) is amended by striking ‘‘subsection (g)

of section 118’’ and inserting ‘‘section 118(f)’’.
	Dec. 9, 2010
	Dec. 9, 2010


See the attached XML files about Akoma Ntoso and the LegalRuleML-LIKE file for permitting to grasp the main idea. The syntax used is a simple meta-model, it doesn’t want to suggest the final syntax.
4.  Pilot Case2
4.1. The Facts

1. In 2000 the UK delivered the Terrorism Act, 2000.

2. In 2006 the UK delivered the Terrorism Act, 2006 that modified the detention period from 28 days to 14 days.

 “25 Expiry or renewal of extended maximum detention period

(3) Schedule 8 to the Terrorism Act 2000 (c. 11) has effect in relation to any further

extension under paragraph 36 of that Schedule for a period beginning at a time

to which this section applies—

(a) as if in sub-paragraph (3)(b) of that paragraph, for “28 days” there were

substituted “14 days”; and

(b) as if that paragraph and paragraph 37 of that Schedule had effect with

the further consequential modifications set out in subsection (4).”

3. In 2007 the UK suspended the sec. 25 of the Terrorism Act 2006 for one year.

“1. This Order may be cited as the Terrorism Act 2006 (Disapplication of Section 25) Order 2007 and shall come into force on 25th July 2007.

2. Section 25 of the Terrorism Act 2006 is disapplied for a period of one year beginning with the coming into force of this Order.”
4.2. Temporal Parameters
Schedule 8 Terrorism Act.
	Act
	Date of assent
	Date of publication
	Date of effect
	URL

	Terrorism Act 2000
	20.7.2000
	24-07-2000
	12th October 2000
section 99 

section 101

subsections (1) to (5) 

Part I of Schedule 8 

paragraph 3, paragraph 4, sub-paragraphs (1) to (5);

Schedule 14 

paragraph 1;

paragraph 6, sub-paragraphs (1) and (4), paragraph 7.
	http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/11/contents
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2000/2800/article/2/made

	
	
	
	31st October 2000

section 4 subsections (3) and (4);

section 5 subsection (1), and subsection (6) paragraph (g);

section 24 subsection (2)(e);

section 31 

section 119

section 123 

Schedule 3 paragraphs 1 to 5;

Schedule 4 paragraph 13, sub-paragraphs (2)(b), (3) and (4); paragraph 27, sub-paragraphs (2)(b), (3) and (4); paragraph 43, sub-paragraphs (2)(b), (3) and (4); and paragraph 52;

Schedule 5, paragraph 10, sub-paragraphs (2) and (3);

Schedule 6 paragraph 4; paragraph 6, sub-paragraph (2), and paragraph 7, sub-paragraph (3);

Schedule 7 paragraph 16, sub-paragraphs (1) and (2), and paragraph 17, sub-paragraph (4); and

Schedule 8 paragraph 1, sub-paragraph (1); and paragraph 19.
	http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2000/2944/article/2/made

	
	
	
	19th February 2001
	http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2001/421/article/2/made

	Terrorism Act 2006
	30th March 2006
	
	13th April 200625th July 2006
Section 25
	http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2006/11/contents
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2006/11/pdfs/ukpgaen_20060011_en.pdf
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2006/1013/article/2/made
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2006/1936/article/2/made

	Order 2007
	24th July 2007
	24th July 2007
	25th July 2007
	http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2007/2181/introduction/made
Suspended the section 25 Terrorism Act 2006 for one year.
“2. Section 25 of the Terrorism Act 2006 is disapplied for a period of one year beginning with the coming into force of this Order.”
THIS RULE IS A META RULES because define the EXTENRAL TEMPORAL PARAMETER of the Section 25 of the Terrorism ACT 2006


The Timeline of the normative system:
12 October 2000 –25 July 2006: days of detention were 28 days

25 July 2006 – 25 July 2007: days of detentions were 14 days
26 July 2007 – 25 July 2008: days of detention were 28 days
5. An XML Representation Model
This syntax is just for permitting to understand the requirements that associate the events with timeBlock, the timeBlock with any part of the rule (head, body, atoms).

This example is an abstract example where e1 and e3 are the inforce dates, e2 and e4 are efficacy dates, 


<legalEvents>



<event id="e1" value="2007-05-30T01:01:00.0Z"/>



<event id="e2" value="2008-05-19T01:01:00.0Z"/>



<event id="e3" value="2012-07-30T01:01:00.0Z"/>




<event id="e4" value="2012-09-01T01:01:00.0Z"/>


</legalEvents>


<timeInfo>



<timeBlock id="t1">




<time start="#e1" refType="#inforce"/>




<time start="#e2" refType="#efficacy"/>



</timeBlock>



<timeBlock id="t2">




<time start="#e3" refType="#inforce"/>




<time start="#e4" refType="#efficacy"/>



</timeBlock>



<timeBlock id="t3">




<time start="#e4" refType="#efficacy"/>



</timeBlock>


</timesInfo>


<ruleInfo id="ruleInfo1" applysTo="#rule_1a #rule_1b">



<sources id="sourceBlock1">




<source applysTo="#rule_1_atom1" idref="#ID1"/>




<source applysTo="#rule_1_atom2" idref="#ID2"/>




<source applysTo="#rule_1_atom3" idref="#ID3"/>



</sources>



<strenght iri="&dfs;defeasible"/>



<timeData id="sourceBlock1">




<timeAssociation applysTo="#rule_1_atom1" idRef="#t1"/>




<timeAssociation applysTo="#rule_1_atom2" idRef="#t1"/>




<timeAssociation applysTo="#rule_1_atom3" idRef="#t2"/>




<timeAssociation applysTo="#rule_1" idRef="#t3"/>



</timeData>



<author idref="#aut1"/>



<creationDateTime idref="e1"/>


</ruleInfo>
6.  References

1. Alchourrón C., Bulygin E., Normative Systems, Pringer-Verlag, Wien, 1971.
2. Guido Governatori, Antonino Rotolo, Régis Riveret, Monica Palmirani, Giovanni Sartor: Variants of temporal defeasible logics for modelling norm modifications. ICAIL 2007: 155-159

3. Guido Governatori, Monica Palmirani, Régis Riveret, Antonino Rotolo, Giovanni Sartor: Norm Modifications in Defeasible Logic. JURIX 2005: 13-22

4. Hernández, R. M., Introducción a la teoría de la norma jurídica, Marcial Pons, Madrid, 2002, cap. 18, pages 499-557.
5. Monica Palmirani, R. Brighi, Time Model for Managing the Dynamic of Normative System, in: AA.VV., Electronic Government 5th International Conference, EGOV 2006, Krakow, Poland, September 4-8, 2006, Proceedings Series: Lecture Notes in Computer Science , BERLIN, Springer, 2006, pp. 207 - 218 (atti di: 5th International Conference, EGOV 2006, Krakow, Poland, September 4-8, 2006)
6. Monica Palmirani, Giuseppe Contissa, Rossella Rubino: Fill the Gap in the Legal Knowledge Modelling. RuleML 2009: 305-314
7. Monica Palmirani, Guido Governatori, Giuseppe Contissa: Modelling temporal legal rules. ICAIL 2011: 131-135

8. Monica Palmirani, Guido Governatori, Giuseppe Contissa: Temporal Dimensions in Rules Modelling. JURIX 2010: 159-162

9. OTHERS please integrate with yours....

10. Sartor, G., Legal reasoning. Springer, 2005.
